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In her exuberant new work, BOBBED HAIR AND BATHTUB GIN, Marion Meade presents a portrait of
four extraordinary writers--Dorothy Parker, Zelda Fitzgerald, Edna St. Vincent Millay, and Edna Ferber--
whose loves, lives, and literary endeavors embodied the spirit of the 1920s.

Capturing the jazz rhythms and desperate gaiety that defined the era, Meade gives us Parker, Fitzgerald,
Millay, and Ferber, traces the intersections of their lives, and describes the men (F. Scott Fitzgerald, Edmund
Wilson, Harold Ross, and Robert Benchley) who influenced them, loved them, and sometimes betrayed
them. Here are the social and literary triumphs (Parker's Round Table witticisms appeared almost daily in the
newspapers and Ferber and Millay won Pulitzer Prizes) and inevitably the penances each paid: crumbled
love affairs, abortions, depression, lost beauty, nervous breakdowns, and finally, overdoses and even
madness.

These literary heroines did what they wanted, said what they thought, living wholly in the moment. They
kicked open the door for twentieth-century women writers and set a new model for every woman trying to
juggle the serious issues of economic independence, political power, and sexual freedom. Meade recreates
the excitement, romance, and promise of the 1920s, a decade celebrated for cultural innovation--the birth of
jazz, the beginning of modernism--and social and sexual liberation, bringing to light, as well, the anxiety and
despair that lurked beneath the nonstop partying and outrageous behavior.

A vibrant mixture of literary scholarship, social history, and scandal, BOBBED HAIR AND BATHTUB
GIN is a rich evocation of a period that will forever intrigue and captivate us.

From the Hardcover edition.
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From reader reviews:

Gabriel Cleveland:

The book Bobbed Hair and Bathtub Gin: Writers Running Wild in the Twenties gives you the sense of being
enjoy for your spare time. You may use to make your capable far more increase. Book can to be your best
friend when you getting anxiety or having big problem using your subject. If you can make looking at a book
Bobbed Hair and Bathtub Gin: Writers Running Wild in the Twenties to become your habit, you can get a lot
more advantages, like add your capable, increase your knowledge about a few or all subjects. You may know
everything if you like start and read a e-book Bobbed Hair and Bathtub Gin: Writers Running Wild in the
Twenties. Kinds of book are a lot of. It means that, science publication or encyclopedia or other people. So ,
how do you think about this reserve?

Roger Sowa:

Hey guys, do you wishes to finds a new book to read? May be the book with the headline Bobbed Hair and
Bathtub Gin: Writers Running Wild in the Twenties suitable to you? The actual book was written by well
known writer in this era. Often the book untitled Bobbed Hair and Bathtub Gin: Writers Running Wild in the
Twentiesis the main of several books that will everyone read now. This specific book was inspired a lot of
people in the world. When you read this reserve you will enter the new dimension that you ever know
previous to. The author explained their concept in the simple way, thus all of people can easily to be aware
of the core of this e-book. This book will give you a large amount of information about this world now. So
you can see the represented of the world in this book.

Amy Arwood:

The book untitled Bobbed Hair and Bathtub Gin: Writers Running Wild in the Twenties is the e-book that
recommended to you to read. You can see the quality of the e-book content that will be shown to a person.
The language that publisher use to explained their ideas are easily to understand. The writer was did a lot of
study when write the book, hence the information that they share to your account is absolutely accurate. You
also can get the e-book of Bobbed Hair and Bathtub Gin: Writers Running Wild in the Twenties from the
publisher to make you a lot more enjoy free time.

Henry Stehle:

Reading can called imagination hangout, why? Because while you are reading a book specially book entitled
Bobbed Hair and Bathtub Gin: Writers Running Wild in the Twenties your thoughts will drift away trough
every dimension, wandering in every single aspect that maybe unknown for but surely will become your
mind friends. Imaging every word written in a publication then become one application form conclusion and
explanation this maybe you never get just before. The Bobbed Hair and Bathtub Gin: Writers Running Wild
in the Twenties giving you another experience more than blown away your head but also giving you useful
info for your better life in this particular era. So now let us explain to you the relaxing pattern this is your



body and mind are going to be pleased when you are finished looking at it, like winning a sport. Do you want
to try this extraordinary spending spare time activity?
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